
Christine, an unincorporated woman <cmssyc@gmail.com>

re W.H.O.'s "monkeypox virus" fraud/delusion: FOIs & a summit
Christine, an unincorporated woman <cmssyc@gmail.com> Thu, Aug 15, 2024 at 10:35 AM
To: Mollie Tomlinson <mollie.tomlinson@courts.im>, alfred.cannan@gov.im, 7054003@sims-communications.co.uk, Chris
Coole <chris.coole@sch.im>, Walter <Walter.Wannenburgh@attgen.gov.im>, dhsc@foi.gov.im, an Kermode <mail@ik.im>,
Andrew Baker <andrewgarriebaker@gmail.com>, Nigel Taylor <nigeltaylor@aol.com>, Doug Stewart
<dougmanx@gmail.com>, Eric Anglin <eric@unity.legal>, Darren Taubitz <darren@advocates.co.im>, Miles Benham
<milesbenham@mannbenham.com>, Andrew Lee <andrew.lee@iom.pnn.police.uk>, Ben Davies
<ben.davies@iom.pnn.police.uk>, DanielJoyce <daniel.joyce@iom.pnn.police.uk>, Joshua Dixon
<joshua.dixon@iom.pnn.police.uk>, Matt Davison <matthew.davison@iom.pnn.police.uk>, Michelle McKillop
<michelle.mckillop@iom.pnn.police.uk>, Rebecca Cowin <rebecca.cowin@iom.pnn.police.uk>, Rebekkah Ringham
<rebekkah.ringham@iom.pnn.police.uk>, Richard Cubbon <richard.cubbon@iom.pnn.police.uk>, rob.callister@gov.im,
bishop@sodorandman.im, archdeacon@sodorandman.im, "Eddie Teare MHK (ex Ayre)" <weteare@manx.net>,
andrew.pollard@paediatrics.ox.ac.uk, Phil Gawne <philliebeg@gmail.com>, Gavin.Callow@iom.police.uk,
amy.beckett@gov.im, Tim Crookall <tim.crookall@gov.im>, Kate Lord-Brennan <kate.lord-brennan@gov.im>, Clare Barber
<clare.barber@gov.im>, Mark Newey <mark.newey@iom.pnn.police.uk>, Jane Poole-Wilson <jane.poole-wilson@gov.im>,
Tanya August-Hanson <tanya.august-hansonmlc@gov.im>, andywint@manxradio.com, AlexBrindley
<alexbrindley@manxradio.com>, Stephen <Stephen.Gadman@iom.police.uk>, Courtenay <Courtenay@manx.net>,
Darren.Gorry@iom.police.uk, Premier of Ontario |Première ministre de l’Ontario <premier@ontario.ca>, Patrick - Mayor
<Patrick.Brown@brampton.ca>, Martin - Councillor <martin.medeiros@brampton.ca>, Rowena - Councillor
<rowena.santos@brampton.ca>, "JUS-G-MAG-CSD-Peterborough-Court-Docs (MAG)"
<Peterborough.Court.docs@ontario.ca>, "JUS-G-MAG-CSD-Peterborough-OCJ-Court (MAG)"
<Peterborough.OCJ.Courts@ontario.ca>, "JUS-G-OCJ-Criminal TC-Peterborough (MAG)"
<Peterborough.ocj.criminal.trialcoordinator@ontario.ca>, "Wilson, Niki (MAG)" <niki.wilson@ontario.ca>, "Murray, Paul T.
(MAG)" <Paul.T.Murray@ontario.ca>, sara.j.macdonald@ontario.ca, "Virtual Crown Peterborough (MAG)"
<VirtualCrownPeterborough@ontario.ca>, Peterborough.Crowns@ontario.ca, joleen.hiland@ontario.ca,
attorneygeneral@ontario.ca, info@parl.gc.ca, Garnett.Genuis@parl.gc.ca, Office of the Premier <premier@gov.ab.ca>,
justin.trudeau@parl.gc.ca, marc.gold@sen.parl.gc.ca, Doug <doug.fordco@pc.ola.org>, Alain.Rayes@parl.gc.ca,
adam.chambers@parl.gc.ca, Ahmed.Hussen@parl.gc.ca, Alex.Ruff@parl.gc.ca, Alain.Therrien@parl.gc.ca, BABrady-
CO@ola.org, Bardish.Chagger@parl.gc.ca, ben.lobb@parl.gc.ca, Bernard.Genereux@parl.gc.ca, blake.richards@parl.gc.ca,
dave.smithco@pc.ola.org, Daisy <daisy.wai@pc.ola.org>, Elisabeth.Briere@parl.gc.ca, earl.dreeshen@parl.gc.ca,
effie.triantafilopoulos@pc.ola.org, Ed Fast <ed.fast@parl.gc.ca>, Elizabeth.May@parl.gc.ca, Filomena.Tassi@parl.gc.ca,
Francesco.Sorbara@parl.gc.ca, Francis.Drouin@parl.gc.ca, francis.scarpaleggia@parl.gc.ca, Gabriel.Ste-Marie@parl.gc.ca,
GBourgouin-QP@ndp.on.ca, Gary.Anand@parl.gc.ca, Gary.Vidal@parl.gc.ca, Han.Dong@parl.gc.ca,
Harjit.Sajjan@parl.gc.ca, Hardeep.Grewal@pc.ola.org, heath.macdonald@parl.gc.ca, Iqra.Khalid@parl.gc.ca, kerry-
lynne.findlay@parl.gc.ca, Kamal.Khera@parl.gc.ca, larry.brock@parl.gc.ca, Larry.Maguire@parl.gc.ca,
Laura.smith@pc.ola.org, natalia.kusendova@pc.ola.org, Natalie.Pierre@pc.ola.org, Neil.Lumsden@pc.ola.org,
nathalie.sinclair-desgagne@parl.gc.ca, Nathaniel.Erskine-Smith@parl.gc.ca, Omar.Alghabra@parl.gc.ca,
rachael.thomas@parl.gc.ca, rachel.bendayan@parl.gc.ca, Randeep.Sarai@parl.gc.ca, Randy.Boissonnault@parl.gc.ca,
Rachel.Blaney@parl.gc.ca, Stephen <stephen.lecce@pc.ola.org>, Salma.Zahid@parl.gc.ca, sam.oosterhoff@pc.ola.org,
sylvia.jones@pc.ola.org, Sameer.Zuberi@parl.gc.ca, tabunsp-qp@ndp.on.ca, Tako.VanPopta@parl.gc.ca,
tips@rebelnews.com, Teresa <tarmstrong-qp@ndp.on.ca>, Taylor.Bachrach@parl.gc.ca, valerie.bradford@parl.gc.ca,
Vance.Badawey@parl.gc.ca, Vic+Fedeli+ <vic.fedeli@pc.ola.org>, Warren.Steinley@parl.gc.ca, WGate-QP@ndp.on.ca, Will
<will.bouma@pc.ola.org>, WandaThomas.Bernard@sen.parl.gc.ca, Xavier.Barsalou-Duval@parl.gc.ca,
Yves.Robillard@parl.gc.ca, yaara.saks@parl.gc.ca, yvan.baker@parl.gc.ca, YuenPau.Woo@sen.parl.gc.ca, yves-
francois.blanchet@parl.gc.ca, 22div.communitystation@peelpolice.ca, 21div.communitystation@peelpolice.ca,
tblackwell@postmedia.com, doug.murphy@corusent.com, troy.reeb@corusent.com, dwalmsley@globeandmail.com,
sarah.fulford@stjoseph.com, amowens@thestar.ca, rroberts@postmedia.com, adonnelly@postmedia.com,
catherine.tait@cbc.ca, barbara.williams@cbc.ca, jfrketich@thespec.com, codi.wilson@bellmedia.ca, MPP London West
<Psattler-qp@ndp.on.ca>, Terence Devin <TKernaghan-QP@ndp.on.ca>, Doug <doug.downey@pc.ola.org>,
arielle.kayabaga@parl.gc.ca, Peter.Fragiskatos@parl.gc.ca, Mark.Holland@parl.gc.ca, Lindsay.Mathyssen@parl.gc.ca,
JagmeetSingh <Jagmeet.Singh@parl.gc.ca>, pierre.poilievre@parl.gc.ca, David.Lametti@parl.gc.ca,
Anita.Anand@parl.gc.ca, pamela.wallin@sen.parl.gc.ca, Jean-Yves.Duclos@parl.gc.ca, ombud@cbc.ca,
neilszts@mcmaster.ca, Bonnie <bonnie.crombie@mississauga.ca>, James.Robinson@attgen.gov.im,
greg.brooks@mail.house.gov, alex.igleheart@mail.house.gov, barbara.boland@mail.house.gov, alex.bolton@mail.house.gov,
kevin.rodgers@mail.house.gov, dawn.clarity@mail.house.gov, Laurie.Windsor@mail.house.gov,
tyler.menzler@mail.house.gov, marycollins.atkinson@mail.house.gov, rachel.harris@mail.house.gov,
Annie.Clark@mail.house.gov, andrea.hitt@mail.house.gov, abby.mchan@mail.house.gov, Nader.Nassiri@mail.house.gov,
dante.cutrona@mail.house.gov, matt.tucker@mail.house.gov, ben.mullany@mail.house.gov, MTGPress@mail.house.gov,
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mtgcorrespondence@mail.house.gov, nick.dyer@mail.house.gov, ronny.jackson@mail.house.gov,
thomas.carufel@mail.house.gov, bryan.brody@mail.house.gov, philip.singleton@mail.house.gov,
julie.singleton@mail.house.gov, lizzie.orr@mail.house.gov, lauren.pelley@cbc.ca, dtletters@telegraph.co.uk,
letters@dailymail.co.uk, expressletters@express.co.uk, letters.editor@ft.com, letters@thetimes.co.uk,
letters@independent.co.uk, mailbox@mirror.co.uk, guardian.letters@theguardian.com, attgen@gov.im,
informationrequest@who.int

Notice to agent is notice to principal; notice to principal is notice to agent.

I hereby challenge anyone at the preposterously-named "W.H.O.", or anywhere else on the planet, to provide/cite valid
scientific evidence of any "monkeypox virus" (or any other alleged "virus").  

Silence will be interpreted as your tacit admission that you cannot provide or cite any, because it doesn't exist.

June 2022: Monkeypox Mania Summit (featuring yours truly)
"Host Alec Zeck of The Way Forward presents a live summit to dissect and debunk the monkey business surrounding
both monkeypox and the theory of pathogenic viruses at large...Over 2 hours of gold!"
https://drsambailey.com/resources/videos/interviews/monkeypox-mania-summit/

Mike Stone's, viroLIEgy "monkeypox" resources: https://viroliegy.com/category/monkeypox/
"Monkeypox virus" FOI responses:

June 15, 2022:
Valery Gheen acting as Government Information Specialist at Fauci’s National Institute of Allergy and Infectious
Diseases (NIAID) confessed to Kristen Welch that “The Division of Intramural Research, Division of Microbiology and
Infectious Diseases, and Division of Clinical Research within the NIAID searched their files” and couldn’t find a single
record written by anyone on the planet, ever, describing any alleged “monkeypox” being found in the bodily fluid/tissue of
a human and purified… in order for “it” to be sequenced, characterized and studied with controlled experiments (aka
“science”):
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/07/NIAID-Kristen-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf

June 10, 2022:
The U.S. Centers for Disease Control and Prevention and the Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry
(CDC/ATSDR) confess that they could not find any record describing anyone on Earth finding an alleged “monkeypox
virus” in the bodily fluid/tissue/excrement of a diseased host (animal or human) and purifying “it”… so that “it” could be
sequenced, characterized and studied with controlled experiments (aka “science”):
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/CDC-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf

August 11, 2022:
Roger Andoh acting as FOIA Officer confessed that the men and women at U.S. Centers for Disease Control and
Prevention and Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry (CDC/ATSDR) have absolutely no
documentation whatsoever regarding the origin of the so-called “monkeypox viron” image posted on their website, or the
methodology used to obtain said image. Since Roger had no documentation to share, he instead quoted claims that were
allegedly made to him by some unidentified man or woman at the National Center for Emerging Zoonotic and Infectious
Diseases. Roger would not disclose whether or not the skin tissue allegedly used in the image had been stored in “virus
transport medium” (containing fetal bovine serum, etc.) prior to imaging, or where the imaging was performed or by who.
Roger’s response indicates that no science whatsoever exists in relation to the so-called ‘monkeypox virus” image.
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/09/CDC-monkey-viron-image-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf

May 31, 2022:
New Zealand‘s crown research institute, the Institute of Environmental Science and Research (ESR), confirmed for
Michael S. that they have no record of any “monkeypox virus” found in and purified from the bodily fluid/tissue/excrement
of any sick human on the planet, by anyone, anywhere, ever:
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/ESR-Monkeypox-PACKAGE-Redacted.pdf

June 17, 2022:
A man or woman working on the “OIA Services Team”, Ministry of Health, New Zealand confessed to Michael S. that the
people running the Ministry have no record of any alleged “monkeypox virus” being found in the bodily fluid/tissue of
anyone on Earth and purified, by anyone, anywhere, ever… in order for “it” to be sequenced, characterized and studied
with controlled experiments:
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/07/NZ-MOH-monkeypox-tetanus-PACKAGE-Redacted.pdf

September 7, 2022:
The folks at both Health Canada and Public Health Agency of Canada conducted thorough searches and had to
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confess that they have no record of anyone on Earth finding any alleged “monkeypox virus” in the bodily
fluid/tissue/excrement of any diseased “host” (animal or human) and then purifying this alleged “virus”… which would
have been necessary in order for this alleged particle to have been sequenced, characterized and studied with valid
scientific controlled experiments.

In other words, they have no scientific evidence that this alleged “virus” particle even exists in alleged hosts, let alone
causes any dis-ease whatsoever:
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/09/HC-PHAC-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf

March 31, 2022:
Lonny J. Pehrson, the man/woman who acts as Assistant Attorney General, Government Records Counsel, State of
Utah, Office of the Attorney General admitted to Kristen Welch that they have no record of any “monkeypox virus” being
found in and purified from the bodily fluid/tissue/excrement of any sick man or woman on the planet, by anyone,
anywhere, ever… and made numerous irrelevant statements to distract from glaring incompetence/fraud:
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Utah-Office-of-Attorney-General-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf

June 6, 2022:
Kendra Washington, woman who acts as Public Records Manager, Florida Department of Health, Office of the General
Counsel confessed to Kristen Welch in response to an FOI for records describing anyone on Earth finding any alleged
“monkeypox virus” in the bodily fluid/tissue/excrement of a diseased host (animal or human) and purifying “it”… so that “it”
could be sequenced, characterized and studied with controlled experiments (aka “science”): “There are no records
responsive to this request.”
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Florida-Dept-of-Health-monkeypox-PACKAGE-no-records-
redacted.pdf

June 6, 2022:
California Department of Public Health confessed to Kristen Welch that they have no record of anyone on Earth finding
any alleged “monkeypox virus” in the bodily fluid/tissue/excrement of a diseased host (animal or human) and purifying “it”
so that “it” could be sequenced, characterized and studied with controlled experiments (aka “science”): “We have yielded
no records….”
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/California-Dept-PH-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf

June 3, 2022:
Sweden’s Public Health Authority Folkhälsomyndigheten confessed to John Blaid that they have no record describing
any alleged “monkeypox virus” being found in the bodily fluid/tissue of anyone on Earth and purified… by anyone,
anywhere, ever… in order for “it” to be sequenced, characterized and studied with controlled experiments.
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Sweden-Folkhalsomyndigheten-monkeypox-PACKAGE.pdf

June 7, 2022:
Gillian Haney, acting as MPH Director, Bureau of Infectious Disease, Massachusetts Department of Public Health
advised Ben Tetzlaff that the target DNA sequences of the monkeypox PCR “test” and the genes that those sequences
represent and the number of cycles used in that “test” cannot be made public because they relate to a national security

asset and security measures 😂, disclosure of which is likely to jeopardize public safety or cyber security and could
compromise future “investigative” efforts and therefore is not in the public interest… and they have no records re the
process used to faux-isolate the imaginary virus:
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Massachusetts-HHS-DPH-monkeypox-test-PACKAGE-
redacted.pdf

July 25, 2022:
Ilone Harrision, acting as Privacy Officer, Public Health Ontario (PHO), confessed that no one at PHO – including
Colleen Geiger, Brian Schwartz, Jessica Hopkins, Samir Patel and Kirandeep Bains – have any record of any alleged
“monkeypox virus” being found in the bodily fluid/tissue of a host and purified… in order for “it” to be sequenced,
characterized and studied with controlled experiments (because virology isn't a science):
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/08/PHO-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf

August 11, 2022:
Some anonymous man or woman working in the Legal Services department at the European Centre for Disease
Prevention and Control confessed that no one there has any record of any alleged “monkeypox virus” being found in the
bodily fluid/tissue of any alleged host and purified… in order for “it” to be sequenced, characterized and studied with
controlled experiments (aka “science”). They suggested that my friend “explore many resources available on PubMed and
Google Scholar” lol.
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/08/Euro-Centre-Disease-Prev-Control-monkeypox-PACKAGE-
redacted.pdf

8/15/24, 10:35 AM Gmail - re W.H.O.'s "monkeypox virus" fraud/delusion: FOIs & a summit

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=80b5ba0454&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-a:r6150555874129840810&simpl=msg-a:r615055587412984… 3/5

https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/09/HC-PHAC-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/09/HC-PHAC-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/09/HC-PHAC-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/09/HC-PHAC-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Utah-Office-of-Attorney-General-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Utah-Office-of-Attorney-General-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Utah-Office-of-Attorney-General-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Utah-Office-of-Attorney-General-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Florida-Dept-of-Health-monkeypox-PACKAGE-no-records-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Florida-Dept-of-Health-monkeypox-PACKAGE-no-records-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Florida-Dept-of-Health-monkeypox-PACKAGE-no-records-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Florida-Dept-of-Health-monkeypox-PACKAGE-no-records-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Florida-Dept-of-Health-monkeypox-PACKAGE-no-records-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/California-Dept-PH-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/California-Dept-PH-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/California-Dept-PH-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/California-Dept-PH-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Sweden-Folkhalsomyndigheten-monkeypox-PACKAGE.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Sweden-Folkhalsomyndigheten-monkeypox-PACKAGE.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Sweden-Folkhalsomyndigheten-monkeypox-PACKAGE.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Sweden-Folkhalsomyndigheten-monkeypox-PACKAGE.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Massachusetts-HHS-DPH-monkeypox-test-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Massachusetts-HHS-DPH-monkeypox-test-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Massachusetts-HHS-DPH-monkeypox-test-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Massachusetts-HHS-DPH-monkeypox-test-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/06/Massachusetts-HHS-DPH-monkeypox-test-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/08/PHO-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/08/PHO-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/08/PHO-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/08/PHO-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/08/Euro-Centre-Disease-Prev-Control-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/08/Euro-Centre-Disease-Prev-Control-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/08/Euro-Centre-Disease-Prev-Control-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/08/Euro-Centre-Disease-Prev-Control-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/08/Euro-Centre-Disease-Prev-Control-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf


June 13, 2022:
S. Campbell (for) John D. Elvidge, City Clerk, City of Toronto confessed that Eileen de Villa and Toronto Public Health
have no records describing anyone on Earth finding and purifying any “monkeypox virus” from the bodily fluid / tissue /
excrement of any diseased host (animal or human):
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2024/08/City-of-Toronto-monkeypox-2022.pdf 

September 9, 2022:
Dr. Eileen “conflict of interest” de Villa and the City Toronto ignored my FOI filed on May 22, 2022… probably because
they have no record of any "monkeypox virus test" that they administer ever being validated against a gold standard
(since it doesn't exist):
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/09/Toronto-monkeypox-tests-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf

August 12, 2022:
Dr. Kyle Wilson acting as as Director, Information Systems & Chief Privacy Officer, Wellington-Dufferin-Guelph Public
Health, Ontario Canada confessed that Nicola Mercer acting as Medical Officer of Health and CEO, Matthew Tenenbaum
acting as Associate Medical Officer of Health, David Kingma acting as Director, Administrative Services, Camille Loucks
acting as Manager, Clinical Services, Karen Mulvey acting as Manager, Vaccine Preventable Diseases, Lillianna Marinko
acting as Manager, Control of Infectious Diseases and the health unit have no record of any alleged “monkeypox virus”
being found in the bodily fluid/tissue of any so-called host and purified, by anyone, anywhere, ever…. despite this being a
preliminary step required to show the existence of a “virus” and despite their monkeypox fear-mongering and despite their
offering of a monkeypox quackcine:
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2024/05/Wellington-Dufferin-Guelph-PH-monkeypox-PACKAGE-
redacted.pdf

June 29, 2022:
Sara Almas who acts as Director of Legislative Services/Clerk at Corporation of the Town of Collingwood, Ontario
Canada confessed to Jess Squilloni that the town has no record of any alleged “monkeypox virus” being found in the
bodily fluid/tissue of any host and purified, by anyone, anywhere, ever:
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/07/Town-of-Collingwood-covid-monkeypox-PACKAGE-
redacted.pdf

Peterborough Public Health and Thomas Piggott, the man who acts as Medical Officer of Health and made a false
report to police about me, have no record describing anyone on Earth finding and purifying any alleged “monkeypox virus”
from the bodily fluids of any diseased human, ever… or any study that in Thomas’ opinion proves the existence of this
alleged virus:
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/05/Peterborough-PH-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf

June 30, 2022:
Larry Stinson, the man who acts as Director of Operations at the “non-profit” Peterborough Public Health decided he's
had quite enough of my “frivolous and/or vexatious” requirements for scientific evidence and bizarrely asserted that my
requests amounted to an “abuse of the right of access” and “interferes” with PPH’s scam… err… operations. Larry used
this as an excuse to deny access to:
all records in the possession, custody or control of Peterborough Public Health that formed the basis of Thomas Piggott
and PPH’s claim that “monkeypox virus” had been confirmed in Peterborough.
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/07/Peterborough-PH-monkeypox-confirmation-PACKAGE-
redacted.pdf

August 9, 2022:
Larry Stinson acting as Director of Operations at the “non-profit” Peterborough Public Health (PPH) has declared war on
transparency and accountability and reached a new low in the wacky world of “virus” FOIs. Larry now labels anyone
asking for evidence of any alleged “virus” as “frivolous and/or vexatious”. Darren, a concerned and hardly-frivolous parent
in Peterborough filed his first-ever FOI to PPH and is now on the receiving end of Larry’s willful obstruction and potentially
slanderous accusations. Instead of providing Darren with documentation that forms the basis of Thomas Piggot and
PPH’s claims that “monkeypox virus” was confirmed in Peterborough, Larry claimed that Darren’s FOI “is frivolous and/or
vexatious, in that it is part of a pattern of conduct that amounts to an abuse of the right of access and interferes with the
operations of Peterborough Public Health”. (Darren then filed an appeal with Patricia Kosseim who acts as Information
and Privacy Commissioner of Ontario (IPC), but according to Lorne Swartz who acts as Registrar the IPC had basically
become useless, having closed their office in March 2020 and being too incompetent to handle appeals remotely.
Naturally the imaginary virus was to blame). See pages 1, 2 and 54:
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2023/01/Peterborough-Public-Health-monkeypox-evidence-
PACKAGE-redacted.pdf

August 15, 2022:
Grey Bruce Health Unit (Ontario) confessed to Jess Clark that, despite announcing to the community in July that a case
of “monkeypox virus” had been “confirmed”, they actually have no proof of this at all and they don’t even have any record
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of anyone on Earth finding the alleged virus in any bodily fluid/tissue and purifying it, ever, so that scientific investigation
could actually take place:
https://www.fluoridefreepeel.ca/wp-content/uploads/2022/09/Grey-Bruce-Health-Unit-monkeypox-PACKAGE-redacted.pdf

All rights reserved.
Christine
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